

O'CONNELL ARONOWITZ
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

December 21, 2022

Via Electronic Mail

jen.dunn@saratoga-springs.org

Jen Dunn, Executive Assistant

Re: Robin Dalton

Dear Ms. Dunn:

Enclosed please find a bill from our office reflecting legal services rendered as well as correspondence and an invoice from Kevin Connolly at Capital Investigations regarding their invoice.

Please remit payment in the total sum of Fifteen-Thousand Seven Hundred Fifty-Five and 00/100 (\$15,755.00) Dollars made payable to O'Connell and Aronowitz.

If you have any questions, please let me know. Thank you.

Respectfully,

O'CONNELL AND ARONOWITZ

By:


Michael P. McDermott, Esq.

MPM/meh
Encl.

EDWARD J. O'CONNELL
1925-1939
SAMUEL E. ARONOWITZ
1925-1973
LEWIS A. ARONOWITZ
1951-1979

IN MEMORIAM:
HON. LEONARD A. WEISS
2020-2022

STEPHEN R. COFFEY
THOMAS J. DINOVO
PAMELA A. NICHOLS
JEFFREY A. SIEGEL
DAVID R. ROSS
KURT E. BRATTEN
MICHAEL P. McDERMOTT
PETERA. PASTORE
KEVIN LAURILLIARD
KELLY J. MIKULLITZ
WILLIAM F. BERGLUND
ROBERT J. KOSHGARIAN
MATTHEW J. DORSEY
FRANCIS J. SMITH, JR.
PAUL C. PASTORE
GRAIG F. ZAPPIA
CHAD A. JEROME

OF COUNSEL
CORNELIUS D. MURRAY
JEFFREY J. SHERRIN
HON. LEONARD A. WEISS
RICHARD S. HARROW
FLORENCE M. RICHARDSON
CRISTINA D. COMMISSO
DANIEL J. TUCZINSKI
KAREN MARTINO VALLE
BRIAN M. CULNAN
ANDREW J. WEISSENBERG

MICHAEL Y. HAWRYLCHAK
SAMANTHA L. FEMIA
MARINA W. CHU
NICHOLAS M. CERVINI
MICHAEL J. LAWSON
COLLEEN R. PIERSON

HOLLY E. VEGAS*
(DIRECTOR, HEALTHCARE
CONSULTING GROUP)

*NOT A MEMBER OF THE
LEGAL PRACTICE

54 STATE STREET • ALBANY, NY 12207 • (p) 518-462-5601 • (f) 518-462-2670

SERVICE BY FAX NOT ACCEPTED.

With offices in Albany and Saratoga Springs.

www.oalaw.com


O'CONNELL ARONOWITZ
 ATTORNEYS AT LAW

54 State Street
Albany, NY 12207
(518) 462-5601

1 Court Street
Saratoga, NY 12866
(518) 584-5205

Jenn Dunn, Executive Assistant
c/o Mayor
City of Saratoga Springs

Statement Date: December 21, 2022
Statement No. 468655
Account No. 33316.000
Page: 1

Investigation NYS Attorney General's Office

FEES

		Hours	
08/03/2022	MPM Receive and review subpoena; Telephone conference with J. Aspland, Esq.; initial meeting with client in Saratoga Springs; travel and follow-up	4.50	1,350.00
08/05/2022	MPM Telephone conference with OAG; Receive and review correspondence from OAG; correspondence to OAG; Telephone conference with A. Izzo, Esq.; correspondence to client	0.50	150.00
08/10/2022	MPM file review and prepare for meeting with client; Telephone conference with client, Receive and review correspondence from client, correspondence to AG	0.70	210.00
08/12/2022	MPM communications with client; Telephone conference with AG re: subpoena compliance	0.30	90.00
08/17/2022	MPM meeting with client in Saratoga Springs; conference with K. Connolly and M. Wheeler re: data harvesting and subpoena compliance; Telephone conference with AG re: subpoena; travel and follow-up	4.90	1,470.00

Please Detach and Return This Portion With Your Remittance

Credit Card Authorization

Please complete this section if you would like to pay your bill via credit card.

Client Name: _____ Visa MasterCard
 Cardholder Name: _____ AmEx Discover
 Cardholder Address: _____

 Card Number: _____ Expiration Date: _____
 Signature: _____ Security Code: _____

Payment Details

Invoices are due upon receipt.

Amount Remitted: _____
 Check No.: _____
 Statement Date: 12/21/2022
 Statement No. 468655
 File No. 33316.000

Thank you for your prompt payment!

Robin Dalton
 Account No. 33316.000
 RE: Investigation NYS Attorney General's Office

Statement Date: 12/21/2022
 Statement No. 468655
 Page No. 2

			Hours	
09/01/2022	MPM	Telephone conference and correspondence with client re: media inquiries; Telephone conference with AG re: subpoena compliance	0.30	90.00
09/02/2022	MPM	correspondence to and from K. Sleight and A. Rizzo; Telephone conference with client; Telephone conference with AG; review tech specifications of data production	0.70	210.00
09/07/2022	MPM	Telephone conference with client; Telephone conference with AG; conf. w/ KS; conference with MW re: data harvesting; file review re: keyword search	1.20	360.00
09/09/2022	MPM	Telephone conference with investigator; Receive and review correspondence from KS, correspondence to KS	0.30	90.00
09/19/2022	MPM	correspondence to and from KC re: cell phone search; refine search terms; forward copy of subpoena	0.40	120.00
09/23/2022	MPM	correspondence to and from AG re: subpoena compliance	0.30	90.00
10/03/2022	MPM	Meeting with investigators re: cell phone extractions; Telephone conference with K. Sleight; Telephone conference with client; travel	1.80	540.00
10/07/2022	MPM	begin review of cell phone extraction; Telephone conference with client re: same	1.50	450.00
10/17/2022	MPM	Receive and review correspondence from client; correspondence to AG	0.20	60.00
10/20/2022	MPM	continued discovery review; Telephone conference with K. Sleight, Esq.; Telephone conference with K. Connolly	2.90	870.00
10/24/2022	MPM	meeting with K. Connolly; review revised data search; draft letter to NYSOAG forwarding search results; Telephone conference with client re: revised search results; correspondence to client re: production to NYSOAG	2.50	750.00
10/25/2022	MPM	Receive and review correspondence from NYSOAG; correspondence to NYSOAG re: subpoena response	0.30	90.00
		FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	23.30	6,990.00

TIMEKEEPER RECAP

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
McDermott, Michael P.	23.30	\$300.00	\$6,990.00

Robin Dalton
Account No. 33316.000
RE: Investigation NYS Attorney General's Office

Statement Date: 12/21/2022
Statement No. 468655
Page No. 3

ADVANCES

10/24/2022	Fed Ex - Recipient: Rick Sawyer, Special Counsel, SNY Office of the Attorney General	17.00
10/27/2022	Investigator - digital forensic examination of mobile device / Capital Investigations Group, LLC	<u>8,748.00</u>
	Total Advances	8,765.00
	Amount Due - current statement	15,755.00
	Balance Due	<u>\$15,755.00</u>

Statements via: Email to Jen.dunn@saratoga-springs.org

If you want to make a payment by credit card or E-check, please go to our website: www.oalaw.com and click on the link - Pay Online. You will be prompted to enter the required information.